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Re: Copyright form A. Sukainah

From: IJSTR Research Publications (editor@ijstr.org)

To: andisukainah@yahoo.com

Date: Saturday, June 28, 2014 at 03:01 PM GMT+7

Dear Author,
Thanks for writing to us!

We have successfully received copyright and registration form for your papers title
"THE EFFECTIVENESS OF PACLOBUTRAZOL AND ORGANIC FERTILIZER FOR THE GROWTH AND YIELD OF
POTATOES (Solanum tuberosum L.) ". 

We have also received the publication fee for your papers and would be published
under July 2014 edition.

Please feel free to write if any query.

Thanks,
Publication Desk - IJSTR
www.ijstr.org

---

On Wed, Jun 25, 2014 at 3:53 AM, Andi Sukainah <andisukainah@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear ijstr
 I am sending rosanna paper with  IJSTR 0714-9395.  registration form, copyright
transfer, payment bill, and paper the was improved.

thanks

On Thursday, February 20, 2014 6:18 AM, Andi Sukainah <andisukainah@yahoo.com>
wrote:

dear ijstr
thank you very much for yours confirm. i want to change name of author, the title, and
some of wards in indonesian laguange 

On Monday, February 17, 2014 8:27 PM, IJSTR Research Publications
<editor@ijstr.org> wrote:
Dear Author,

Please clarify what you want to change,Only author name or
something else. 

Thanks,

http://www.ijstr.org/
mailto:andisukainah@yahoo.com
mailto:andisukainah@yahoo.com
mailto:editor@ijstr.org


6/23/23, 11:16 AM Yahoo Mail - Re: Copyright form A. Sukainah

about:blank 2/2

Publication Desk - IJSTR
www.ijstr.org
---

On Mon, Feb 17, 2014 at 6:03 AM, Andi Sukainah <andisukainah@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Ijstr

can i replace my paper that was published in May 2013. one of the writers of the
paper is not correct. thank you..

On Friday, May 3, 2013 8:53 PM, IJSTR Research Publications <editor@ijstr.org>
wrote:
Dear Author,

Please re-submit your reg form as you have mentioned paper id 6413 instead of
6416.

Thanks,
Publication Team
www.ijstr.org

On Thu, May 2, 2013 at 9:00 AM, Andi Sukainah <andisukainah@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear IJSTR

I sent my registration form, copyright form, and transfer for payment
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