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Fwd: GJEE, Vol.19, No.2 - Kit for Authors

From: ruslan ruslan (ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com)
To: ruslan_math_unm@yahoo.com

Date: Thursday, May 18, 2017 at 01:49 PM GMT+7

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Date: Fri, May 12, 2017 at 2:50 PM

Subject: GJEE, Vol.19, No.2 - Kit for Authors

To: ruslan ruslan <ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com>

Dear Prof. Ruslan

Thank you very much for your kind message and your willingness to publish an article in the Global Journal of
Engineering Education (GJEE). We will be happy to consider your article for inclusion in the GJEE, Vol.19, No.2.

Attached, please find a kit for authors. This should assist you in the preparation of your article.

In preparing your article, you should not make any changes to the template, and strictly follow the Instruction for
Authors. Please do not use bold faces in the article nor in the figures! The abstract must not exceed 12 lines. Also
please note that a single line space must be placed between the paragraphs, figure, captures, equations, formulas,
etc. Further, would you please supply us with the original, unsaved figures, so that we can access them and make
necessary corrections if required? We accept figures generated in Ms Word, Excel and Visio. More information can
be found at the journal's site:

www.wiete.com.au

Also, please note that submitted articles must be accompanied by the fully filled in and signed Submission
Form & Payment Details. However, you do not need to pay the publication fee at this stage. You will be asked to
do so, when the article has been refereed positively.

I look forward to receiving your contribution to the GJEE journal.

Kindest regards

Zenon J. Pudlowski

From: ruslan ruslan [mailto:ruslan.ppsunm@gmail. com]
Sent: Friday, 12 May 2017 12:21
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To: info@wiete.com.au
Subject: Manuscript Submission

To: the Editor-in-chief

[Global Journal of Engineering Education (GJEE)]

Dear Editor,

Please find enclosed our article entitted “The Efectiveness of Cooperative Setting Realistic Mathematic
Learning Model (Maresko) of the NHT Type on Three Dimension (3D) Main Theme”

Please consider it for publication in Global Journal of Engineering Education (GJEE). | certify that this article has
neither not been published nor has been submitted for publication elsewhere, and will not be submitted for
publication elsewhere without written permission from you.

Yours faithfully,

Prof. Ruslan

Universitas Negeri Makassar, Indonesia

GJEE-Instruction4Authors.pdf
19.8kB

GJEE-SampleArticle.pdf
99.7kB

GJEE-Submission&Payment.pdf
17.1kB

GJEE-Template.doc
31kB
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Fwd: GJEE, Vol.19, No.2 - Article Acceptance

From: ruslan ruslan (ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com)
To: ruslan_math_unm@yahoo.com

Date: Monday, June 19, 2017 at 09:40 AM GMT+7

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Date: Sat, Jun 10, 2017 at 3:17 AM

Subject: GJEE, Vol.19, No.2 - Article Acceptance

To: ruslan ruslan <ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com>

Dear Prof. Ruslan

| wish to advise you that your article has been now assessed by three international referees and, as such, has been
accepted for inclusion in the GJEE, Vol.19, No.2.

In order for us to commence processing of the article, you should now pay the article publication fee as per the
Submission Form & Payment Details.

I look forward to hearing from you at your earliest convenience.

Kindest regards

Zenon J. Pudlowski
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Fwd: GJEE, Vol.19, No.3 - Proofs of your article

From: ruslan ruslan (ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com)
To: ruslan_math_unm@yahoo.com; basosappaile@yahoo.co.id

Date: Friday, July 21, 2017 at 05:02 PM GMT+7

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Date: Tue, Jul 18, 2017 at 6:51 PM

Subject: GJEE, Vol.19, No.3 - Proofs of your article

To: ruslan ruslan <ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com>

Dear Mr Ruslan

Attached, please find the proofs of your article corrected and formatted by us in accordance with the WIETE style, to
be included in the GJEE, Vol.19, No.3. Please read the article carefully and note that only spelling mistakes and
simple typos can be corrected at this stage.

I look forward to hearing from you by Friday, 21 July 2017 at the latest. Should we not hear from you by the due day,
we will assume that you are happy with the article in its present form and that the corrections done by us are OK.

Kindest regards

Zenon J. Pudlowski

21-Ruslan-XX.pdf
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Fwd: Receipts

From: ruslan ruslan (ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com)
To: ruslan_math_unm@yahoo.com; basosappaile@yahoo.co.id

Date: Friday, July 21, 2017 at 05:03 PM GMT+7

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Date: Tue, Jul 4, 2017 at 11:58 PM

Subject: Receipts

To: ruslan ruslan <ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com>

Dear Mr Ruslan

Attached, please find two receipts as requested.

Kindest regards

Zenon J. Pudlowski

From: ruslan ruslan [mailto:ruslan.ppsunm@gmail. com]
Sent: Wednesday, 5 July 2017 12:56

To: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Subject: Re: Publication fee

Dear Zenon J.Pudlodski,

| do apologize because the very late payment. It is no problem if the two papers will be included in the GJEE, Vol 19
No 3. So please process the two papers for publication to the next issue. In addition, I'm waiting the two receipts
each $A500 for the two authors.

Thank you very much for your kind cooperation

Best Regards,

Prof. Ruslan

On Mon, Jul 3, 2017 at 9:54 PM, Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au> wrote:

Dear Mr Ruslan

Thank you very much for your message.
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| regret to inform you that the GJEE, Vol.19, No.2 is now ready for publication, and your articles have
not been included in this issue, due to the on-time lack of payment of the publication fee.

Should you wish to pursue the matter further, the two articles may be included in the GJEE, Vol.19,
No.3.

Further, we do not issue invoices as the Submission Form & Payment Details acts as a "pro forma"
invoice. However, should you still wish to pursue the publication of your papers, we will be able to
issue two receipts each of $A500 and send them electronically to Ruslan and Sappaile.

I look forward to hearing from you at your earliest convenience.

Kindest regards

Zenon J. Pudlowski

From: ruslan ruslan [mailto:ruslan.ppsunm@gmail. com]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 July 2017 14:39

To: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Cc: sappaile.baso@gmail.com

Subject: Re: Publication fee

Dear Zenon J. Pudlowski,

| have sent two publication fees together in one go. The fees are for the following papers:

1. The Effectiveness of Cooperative Setting Realistic Mathematics Learning Model (Maresko) of the NHT Type on
Three Dimension (3D) Main Theme written by Ruslan, Alimuddin, and Nasrullah

2. The Influence of Problem-solving Method towards Student’s Mathematics Learning Outcomes written by Baso
Intang Sappaile, and Nurwati Djam'an

please find the attachment of the payment proof AUD 1000. Could you please make invoices for those two
papers separately?

thank you for your cooperation

Best Regards,

Prof. Ruslan

On Wed, Jun 21, 2017 at 12:08 AM, ruslan ruslan <ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Zenon J. Pudlowski,
Thank you very much for your information. | will transfer the publication fee tomorrow

Best Regards,

about:blank 2/3


mailto:ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com
mailto:zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au
mailto:sappaile.baso@gmail.com
mailto:ruslan.ppsunm@gmail.com

6/19/23, 7:19 PM Yahoo Mail - Fwd: Receipts

about:blank

Prof Ruslan

On Wed, Jun 21, 2017 at 2:39 PM, Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au> wrote:

Dear Ruslan

Yes, you can transfer the two publication fees together in one go. No problem as it will reduce
the cost of transfer.

Kindest regards

Zenon J. Pudlowski

From: ruslan ruslan [mailto:ruslan.ppsunm@gmail. com]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 June 2017 14:07

To: Zenon Pudlowski <zenon.pudlowski@wiete.com.au>
Subject: Publication fee

Dear Zenon Pudlowski,

There are two papers from Universitas Negeri Makassar which have been accepted for inclusion in GJEE, Vol 19 no 2.
They are as follows

1. The Efectiveness of Cooperative Setting Realistic Mathematic Learning Model (Maresko) of the NHT Type on Three
Dimension (3D) Main Theme Written by Ruslan, Alimuddin, and Nasrullah

2. The Influence of Problem-solving Method towards Student’s Mathematics Learning Outcomes” for consideration by
Global Journal of Engineering Education (GJEE) written by Baso Intang Sappaile, and Nurwati Djam'an

The publication fee of those papers will be transferred to your bank. I would like to ask you whether I can transferred
the money at once or not.

Best Regards,

Prof. Ruslan

20-Sappaile-B-GJ-01.pdf
34.5kB

21-Ruslan-GJ-02.pdf
34.5kB
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